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THURSDAY 
 

T12:900  :  Army Painting, Basic Black, Multi-figure 10mm 

Thursday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-11 
Teacher: Todd Pressley 

Masks Required? No 

Description: This class uses the black primer technique to quickly paint 
figures for the tabletop. The goal is to complete a 10 mm base within the 
class time. Discussions include how to cover the black base layer with 
white, red, and yellow. The student will receive baggage or limber with 
horses and riders to take home as a model to continue using this style of 
painting. Young persons are welcome if accompanied by an adult also in 
the class. This class is sponsored by The Wargaming Company. 
 

T12:901  :  Dirty and Distressed 

Thursday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-12 
Teacher: Gregory Zuniga 

Masks Required? No 

Description: When a soldier has been on the front lines for months (or 
years!) some basic rules and techniques apply to make him look 
appropriate. We'll discuss the effect of wear and the elements on cloth, 
leather, metal and bone, and then do some hands-on practice with adding 
dirt and decay to your minis. There will be brushes and paint you can use, 
and you can bring your own prepped mini or we'll have some available. 
 

T12:902  :  Budget Troops 

Thursday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-13 
Teacher: Don Goddard 

Masks Required? No 

Description: Create hordes of 10mm troop stands for pennies each using 
plastic canvas/granny grating. Perfect for trying out a new period or army 
without spending a fortune. Units created will have soldiers roughly 10mm 
tall, and can include mounted units and artillery. 
 

T12:903  :  A Garden Worth Fighting For 

Thursday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-14 
Teacher: Tim Peaslee 

Masks Required? No 

Description: A small garden makes a great piece of scenery for your 
gaming table, and it covers nearly all periods. This class will show you 
techniques for using assorted materials to create a very nice looking 
terrain piece. 
 

T14:904  :  Army Painting, Multi-figure, Gauls 

Thursday, 2:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-11 
Teacher: Todd Pressley 

Masks Required? No 

Description: This class covers techniques and tricks to help you get more 
done, faster. The goal of this class is not to have the greatest looking 
figure but the greatest looking army. Discussions will include planning your 
work, workspace efficiency, creating tools, and painting effectively. A little 
bit of color theory as it applies to army painting. This class will give you 
something to take home for your use in your style of painting. Young 
persons are welcome if accompanied by an adult also in the class. 
 

T14:905  :  Painting Black and White 

Thursday, 2:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-12 
Teacher: Gregory Zuniga 

Masks Required? No 

Description: Trying to get those blacks and white colors sharp on uniforms 
can be difficult. Finding the color to be too gray? Come and join us in this 
class to talk about and paint what can be considered some of the most 
difficult colors to paint. Then how to alter these colors to form black and 
white colors to improve a paint scheme. 
 

T14:906  :  Twisted Wire Trees 

Thursday, 2:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-13 
Teacher: Don Goddard 

Masks Required? No 

Description: Learn how to quickly and cheaply populate your game table 
with great looking coniferous trees. 
 

T14:907  :  Craft Stick Barns & Outbuildings 

Thursday, 2:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-14 
Teacher: Tim Peaslee 

Masks Required? No 

Description: Coffee stir sticks and craft sticks make excellent material for 
building barns and outbuildings for your gaming table. Come and learn 
easy techniques for creating custom farm buildings for your troops to fight 
over. 
 

T16:908  :  Introduction to Weathering 

Thursday, 4:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-11 
Teacher: Dennis Jensen 

Masks Required? No 

Description:  
 

T16:909  :  Foam Shipwrecks 

Thursday, 4:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-13 
Teacher: Don Goddard 

Masks Required? No 

Description: Do you need a shipwreck or two for your adventure? With 
some time and simple tricks you can create a custom shipwreck out of 
foam, twine, and craft sticks. 

 
FRIDAY 
 

F10:910  :  Army Painting, Multi-figure, 10mm 

Friday, 10:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-11 
Teacher: Todd Pressley 

Masks Required? No 

Description: This class covers techniques and tricks to help you get more 
done, faster. The goal of this class is to create a full 10 mm base within the 
class time. Discussions will include planning your work, workspace 
efficiency, creating tools, and painting effectively. The student will receive 
a base of Napoleonic infantry to take home as a model for continuing in 
this style of painting. Young persons are welcome if accompanied by an 
adult also in the class. This class is sponsored by The Wargaming 
Company. 
 

F10:911  :  Dirty and Distressed 

Friday, 10:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-12 
Teacher: Gregory Zuniga 
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Masks Required? No 

Description: When a soldier has been on the front lines for months (or 
years!) some basic rules and techniques apply to make him look 
appropriate. We'll discuss the effect of wear and the elements on cloth, 
leather, metal and bone, and then do some hands-on practice with adding 
dirt and decay to your minis. There will be brushes and paint you can use, 
and you can bring your own prepped mini or we'll have some available. 
 

F10:912  :  A Garden Worth Fighting For 

Friday, 10:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-14 
Teacher: Tim Peaslee 

Masks Required? No 

Description: A small garden makes a great piece of scenery for your 
gaming table, and it covers nearly all periods. This class will show you 
techniques for using assorted materials to create a very nice looking 
terrain piece. 
 

F12:913  :  Army Shield Painting, Gauls 

Friday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-11 
Teacher: Todd Pressley 

Masks Required? No 

Description: A common issue amongst painted armies is flat and lifeless 
shields. This class teaches how to paint a Gallic shield pattern. Complete 
your Gallic army painting figure. This technique is applicable to many dark 
and middle age armies. The student will learn shading techniques that add 
depth to patterns and add interest to the miniature. This is an army 
painting class that helps get more patterns done while still providing a 
varied pattern to your army or warband. Young persons are welcome if 
accompanied by an adult also in the class. 
 

F12:914  :  Painting Faces and Flesh 

Friday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-12 
Teacher: Gregory Zuniga 

Masks Required? No 

Description: This class will give you great techniques for painting that 
extra tricky part of the mini, the face, and how to get a just right skin tone. 
This is an intermediate class and knowledge of blending is helpful. 
 

F12:915  :  Pink Foam Building Techniques 

Friday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-14 
Teacher: Tim Peaslee 

Masks Required? No 

Description: Building terrain with pink (or blue) foam has become very 
popular. This class will show you the common tools used and teach you 
the  basic techniques to create gaming terrain from insulation foam. 

 
SATURDAY 
 

S10:916  :  Flag Painting by Cheating 

Saturday, 10:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-11 
Teacher: Todd Pressley 

Masks Required? No 

Description: This class discusses how to create painted banners for your 
army without being a master painter.  The student will learn about tools 
used to create banners.  Techniques to leverage our photo and graphics 
references to create banners.  The goal of this class will be to create a 
painted banner with battle honors using supplies for this class.  This is an 

intermediate painting class, familiarity with paints and fine brushes is 
required. Young persons are welcome if accompanied by an adult also in 
the class. 
 

S10:917  :  Pink Foam Building Techniques 

Saturday, 10:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-14 
Teacher: Tim Peaslee 

Masks Required? No 

Description: Building terrain with pink (or blue) foam has become very 
popular. This class will show you the common tools used and teach you 
the basic techniques to create gaming terrain from insulation foam. 
 

S12:918  :  Army Painting, Up a notch, Multi-figure 10mm 

Saturday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-11 
Teacher: Todd Pressley 

Masks Required? No 

Description: This class explores 10 mm figures as historical models worthy 
of a little extra time. The class develops tabletop quality 10 mm pieces 
with just a bit more effort than block paint and wash. This class 
concentrates on getting robust shadows and highlights that make the unit 
pop! The student will paint some troops to take home as an example of 
this style of painting. This is an intermediate painting class, familiarity with 
paints and fine brushes is required. Young persons are welcome if 
accompanied by an adult also in the class. This class is sponsored by The 
Wargaming Company. 
 

S12:919  :  Shingles and Thatch 

Saturday, 12:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-14 
Teacher: Tim Peaslee 

Masks Required? No 

Description: The roof of a model is one of the first things others will notice 
about your model buildings. There are lots of techniques to build an 
effective looking roof. This class will discuss and show examples of the 
many techniques for creating an attractive roof for your models. These 
techniques range from simple cereal box cut to more labor intensive 
techniques such as teddy bear fur, cast shingles, and rope/chip brush 
thatch. 
 

S14:920  :  Painting Faces and Flesh 

Saturday, 2:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-13 
Teacher: Gregory Zuniga 

Masks Required? No 

Description: This class will give you great techniques for painting that 
extra tricky part of the mini, the face, and how to get a just right skin tone. 
This is an intermediate class and knowledge of blending is helpful. 
 

S16:921  :  Earth and Stone 

Saturday, 4:00 PM, 1.5 hrs, Students: 8, Location: Conestoga: CO-13 
Teacher: Gregory Zuniga 

Masks Required? No 

Description: Whether it is bricks, castle wall, back wood trail, or trench, 
stone and earth feature in a large number of bases, displays, and terrain 
features. Join Greg as he teaches a shaded and wet blending technique to 
get it looking natural in little time. 
 

S20:922  :  Iron Paintbrush 

Saturday, 8:00 PM, 4 hrs, Students: 16, Location: Commonwealth Foyer: 
Bottom of Escalator 
Teacher: Todd Pressley 
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Masks Required? No 

Description: If you've never seen or heard of Iron Paintbrush (where have 
you been?), try to imagine The Iron Chef merged with Chopped, but using 
paints and miniatures.  The Hobby University Staff sets a theme, provides 
paints, brushes, glues, miniatures, and other items. Each of the teams 
strive to assemble the most creative representation of the theme in the 
allotted time.  Sounds easy, right?  Well, the Hobby U team will be sure to 
throw some curve balls, giving you the chance to win extra points or get 
additional benefits such as extra time or colors – or something else that no 
one else will have. Each team consists of 2 to 4 people, join us Saturday at 
8pm for a great time. 


